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Errata
1. Whaley PA, Voudrie MA II. Stability of 

vancomycin in SyrSpend SF. IJPC 2012; 
16(2): 167–169. Page 168, (1) under the 
subheading Preparation of Vancomycin 
Hydrochloride Suspension Samples, the 
first vancomycin HCl suspension was 
prepared by adding 25000 mg (or 25.0 g) 
of vancomyin HCl powder to a 500-mL 
volumetric flask, not 250 mg of vanco-
mycin HCl as published; (2) in the same 
section, the second vancomycin HCl sus-
pension was prepared by adding 25000 
mg (or 25.0 g) of vancomycin HCl sterile 
pharmacy bulk product to a 500-mL volu-
metric flask, not 250 mg of vancomycin 
HCl as published. 

2. Geiger CM, Voudrie MA II, Sorenson B. 
Stability of propranolol hydrochloride in 
SyrSpend SF. IJPC 2012; 16(6): 513–515. 
Page 514, under the subheading Prepara-
tion of Propranolol Hydrochloride Sus-
pension Samples. The amount of propran-
olol HCl used in preparing the suspension 
was incorrectly shown as 103.4 g, and it 
should have been shown as 103.4 mg.

3. Geiger CM, Voudrie MA II, Sorenson 
B. Stability of ursodiol in SyrSpend 
SF cherry flavored. IJPC 2012; 16(6): 
510–512. Page 510, (1) under the Introduc-
tion, third paragraph, the suspension was 
stored in a low-actinic plastic bottle at a 
concentration of 30 mg/mL, not 30 mcg/
mL as published; (2) within the Abstract, 
the studied sample was compounded into 
a 3-mg/mL suspension, not a 30 mcg/mL 
suspension as published; (3) under the 
heading Stability Study, the concentra-
tion of the sample of ursodiol suspended 
in SyrSpend SF Cherry Flavored was at a 
concentration of 30 mg/mL, not a concen-
tration of 30 mcg/mL as published.

The authors apologize for these oversights 
and for any inconvenience the errors may 
have caused.
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